
Alice Lamb
BS3 Community

We are a small team so having 
students on placement is really 
helpful for us, especially in helping 
us set up new projects. We are a 
charity that responds to the needs 
of our community, and we are very 
proud of what we do so it's nice to 
share that with students looking to 
work in the charity sector. 

Our placement student went above 
and beyond with every task we set 
her, and the experience exceeded 
our expectations. She was efficient, 
thorough, and professional when 
carrying out research and 
representing the charity. 

Our student supported us with 
setting up and carrying out two new 
services for the charity. Her work on 

the project meant we were able to 
roll out the services more quickly 
and smoothly.

One of the highlights of the 
placement was our student’s help 
with our 'Pass the Parcel' project 
over Christmas. She organised 
donations and delivered parcels to 
low-income families in the area, and 
her help was so greatly appreciated 
by us and the residents receiving 
them. 

To any students thinking of taking 
part in the scheme, my advice 
would be to ask to get involved with 
the things you find interesting, and 
don't be afraid to ask lots of 
questions.

“Our student’s support 

allowed us to roll out our 

new services more 

quickly and smoothly.”
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